
D – Decision
Decide to receive Jesus Christ as your Saviour.

Decide to follow Him for the rest of your life.

Decide to  seek  God’s  help  to  turn  from  all
wrongdoing and to seek only what pleases Him.

Jesus  said,  “Behold,  I  stand  at  the  door  and
knock. If anyone hears My voice and opens the
door  (of the heart),  I  will  come in to him and
dine with him, and he with Me” Revelation 3:20.

He also said  “For God so loved the world that
He  gave  His  only  begotten  Son,  that  whoever
believes  in  Him  should  not  perish  but  have
everlasting life” John 3:16. The truth is this:

God loves you and Christ died for you. Your
greatest need is to receive Him now as your

Lord and Saviour.
There are simple Bible Study aids that can

help you to know more about God’s love for
you and His plan for your life. We care, so for

more information, Email
GoodNewsForYoujohn316@gmail.com
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The A B C of Salvation

A - Agree: 
The first thing we must do is to agree with what
God says about us. The Bible says: “for all have
sinned and  fall  short  of  the  glory  of  God”
Romans 3:23. There are no exceptions to this.

Christ  is  God’s  perfect  standard  that  we  must
measure ourselves by. And all fall short of this! 

God is perfect in all  His ways.  His Son, Jesus
Christ lived a perfect life. The Bible says that He
is holy, harmless and undefiled in all His ways. 

For Christ did no sin, knew no sin, and in
Him there is no sin. He was God manifest in

flesh.

We must  agree that  all  are sinful in His eyes.
There are NO exceptions to this rule. The Bible
says our sins have separated us from our God.

We must agree with the truth about ourselves as
taught  by  Jesus.  By  humbling  ourselves,  we
begin our journey back to God. God exalts the
humble  and  He  brings  down  the  proud.  Jesus
took a small child and said,  “Whoever humbles
himself as this little child is the greatest in the
kingdom of heaven” Matthew 18:4.

B – Believe:
The Bible also says: “Believe on the Lord Jesus
Christ, and you will be saved” Acts 16:31.

Believe that Jesus Christ died for your sins, and
fully  paid  the  penalty  that  God  demands,  the
penalty that we deserve and cannot repay.

Believe  that only Christ was perfect  enough to
redeem  us,  and  there  are  no  religious
observances that can save us from sin’s penalty.

Believe  Christ died personally for you. He died
as a sacrifice for your sins, for “In Him we have
redemption through His blood, the forgiveness of
sins, according to the riches of His grace” Eph
1:7.

C – Confess:
Confess means to own up to Him for our wrong
doing and repent, meaning to have a change of
heart about sin and our need of His forgiveness.

The Bible says,  “that if you  confess with your
mouth the Lord Jesus and believe in your heart
that God has raised Him from the dead, you will
be saved” Romans 10:9. You will be saved!


